A W N

Amendment 1 to Council Resolution No. 11-2018

BY: The Chairperson at the Legislative Day No. 2
request of the County Executive Date: February 5, 2018

Amendment No. 1

(This amendment corrects the percentages of taxes subject to abatement pursuant to the Payment
in Lieu of Taxes Agreement.)

In the Agreement, attached to the Resolution as Exhibit 1, on page 2, in section 1.(b)(2), strike
“forty percent (40%)” and substitute “thirty percent (30%)”.

In the Agreement, attached to the Resolution as Exhibit 1, on page 2, in section 1.(b)(3), strike
“twenty-five percent (25%)” and substitute “twenty percent (20%)”.




