
Amendment 1 to Council Resolution No. 58-2018

BY: Chairperson at the request Legislative Day No. 6
of the County Executive Date: May 31, 2018

Amendment No. 1

(This amendment removes an obsolete fee for a waiver request, Design Manual

Alternative.)

1 On the fourth page of the Fee Schedules attached to the Resolution as filed, strike:

2 "WAIVER REQUEST - DESIGN MANUAL ALTERNATIVE

3 $250 for alternative design to meet a technical design

4 Standard."

5 On thejifth page ofth^Fee Schedules attached to thej^esolution as prefiled:

6 1. Strike the double brackets before "SINGLE" and substitute "ESTABLISHMENT OF A";

7 2. Strike "$200" and substitute "$25"; and

8 3. Strike the double brackets after "Fee".

AB8PTEO$±^
ritiu

—U ^,51 /(S

A'O^^Ul£^

ENRA1CR58-2018



Amendment I to Amendment 1 to Council Resolution No. 58-2018

BY: Chairperson at the request
of the County Executive

Legislative Day No.

Date: May 31,2018

Amendment No. to Amendment 1

(This amendment alters the Single Site Historic District Application Fee.)

1 On page 1, in line 5, insert:

2 "On the fifth page of the Fee Schedules attached to the Resolution as prefiled:

3 1. Strike the double brackets before "SINGLE" and substitute "ESTABLISHMENT OF A";

4 2. Strike "$200" and substitute "$25"; and

5 3. Strike the doubleL bracket^ after "Fee","

£>l^i&

Am to Am 1 to CR 58


