Jntroduceﬂ——%
Public Hearing —- T,

Council Action —=2>-f&
Executive Action —=
Effeclive Date

County Council Of Howard County, Maryland

2019 Legislative Session Legislative Day No.

BilNo. | S 2019

Introduced by: The Chairperson at the request of the County Executive

AN ACT adopting certain national codes as the Howard County Property Maintenance Code
for Rental Housing; adopting local amendments; making certain technical corrections;
and generally relating to the Howard County Property Maintenance Code for Rental

Housing.

Introduced and read first time Qleg_:_i_l_i, 2019, Ordered posted and hearing scheduled.

By order

Jessrca Feldmark, Administrator

Having been posted and notice of time & place of hearjng & litle of Bill having been published according to Charter, the Bill was read
for a second time at a public hearing on , 2019,

By order

Jessica Feldmark, Administrator

This Bill was read the third time oxm%@, 2019 and Passed __, Passed with amendments \/,Failed

By order
JessicaFeldmark, Administrator

Sealed with the County Seal and presented to the County Executive for approval this "7 day of Mﬂ,, 2019 at _3
’

e T L e v d
{ Approveé/vetocd by the County Executive _% A . { , 2019

Calvin Bali, C(TLTEty Executive

NOTE: [[text int brackets]] indicates deletions from existing law; TEXT IN SMALL CAPITALS indicates additions to existing [aw;
Strike-out indicates material deleted by amendment; Underlining indicates material added by amendment,



L=~ TN T R I~ T . T - R VS S OV R

[FCREEE PE R NG TR NG S NG S N S N T < S N S & T & S R T e e e e o e w i e
[ e T = T - T -~ "SR S O SU S G O Tt~ Y I I =2 T . T - W B o5 B

Section 1, Be It Enacted by the Coimty Council of Howard County, Maryland, that the

Howard County Code is amended as follows:

By repealing and reenacting:

Title 3. Buildings.
Subtitle 7. Property Maintenance Code for Rental Housing.
Section 3.700. Howard County Property Maintenance Code for Rental Housing.

By amending:

Title 14. Licenses, Inspections and Permits
Subtitle 9. Rental Housing Licenses
Section 14.900(0).

Title 3. Buildings.
Subtitle 7. Property Maintenance Code for Rental Housing.

SECTION 3.700. HOWARD COUNTY PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE FOR RENTAL

HOUSING.

(8)

(B)

ADOPTION OF NATIONAL CODE, EXCEPT AS PROVIDED IN SUBSECTION (B} OF THIS
SECTION, THE INTERNATIONAL PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE, 2018, AS
PUBLISHED BY THE INTERNATIONAL CODE COUNCIL IS HEREBY ADOPTED AS THE
HowARD COUNTY PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE FOR RENTAL HOUSING.
LOCAL AMENDMENTS. THE FOLLOWING AMENDMENTS MODIFY CERTAIN PROVISIONS
OF THE ADOPTED CODE. |
(1)  INGENERAL.
3] AS USED IN THIS SUBTITLE, THE TERM “THIS CODE” SHALL MEAN THE
HOWARD COUNTY PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE FOR RENTAL
HOoUSING.
() AS USED IN THIS SECTION, THE TERM “CODE OFFICIAL” SHALL MEAN
THE DIRECTOR OF THE DEPARTMENT OF INSPECTIONS, LICENSES A

AND PERMITS OR THE DIRECTCR’S AUTHORIZED DESIGNEE.



R =T - Y L

7S S T N T o o I S S S S A T T T T T S
[ S = S - T - SERC, B NV S U VT B N R = " T ~ - N R+ R &, N - N VL S S

2)

©)

(1) | WHERE THE NAME OF THE JURISDICTION IS TO BE INDICATED IN ANY
SECTION OF THIS CODE, INSERT “HOWARD COUNTY, MARYLAND”,

Svssecrion 101.1 TITLE.

DELETE THIS SUBSECTION AND SUBSTITUTE THE FOLLOWING:

101.1 TiTLE. THESE REGULATIONS SHALL BE KNOWN AS THE HOWARD

COUNTY PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE FOR RENTAL HOUSING,

HEREINAFTER REFERRED TO AS “THIS CODE”.

SuBSECTION 101.2 SCOPE.,

DELETE THIS SUBSECTION AND SUBSTITUTE THE FOLLOWING!

101.2 SCOPE.

) THE SCOPE OF THIS CODE IS LIMITED TO EXISTING STRUCTURES IN
THE FOLLOWING OCCUPANCIES AS DEFINED IN THE HOWARD
COUNTY BUILDING CODE:

A, INSTITUTIONAL, USE GROUP I-1; AND
B. RESIDENTIAL,
i Usk GrouPrs R-1, R-2, R-4; AND
1. UsEk GROUPS R-3 THAT ARE NO'I/". OWNER-OCCUPIED,
OCCUPIED BY THE OWNER'S IMMEDIATE FAMILY, OR
OWNER-OCCUPIED WITH 2 OR MORE ROOMERS OR
BOARDERS.

(1) THIS CODE SHALL NOT APPLY TO THE FOLLOWING EXISTING
OCCUPANCIES AS DEFINED IN THE HOWARD COUNTY BUILDING
CODE:

ASSEMBLY, ALL USE GROUPS;

BUSINESS, USE GROUP B;

EDUCATIONAL, USE GROUP E;

FACTORY AND INDUSTRIAL USE GROUPS F-1 AND F-2;

HIGH HAZARD, ALL USE GROUPS;

INSTITUTIONAL, USE GROUPS I-2, [-3, AND I-4;

MERCANTILE, USE GROUP M; AND

= o= ® 9 0w p

RESIDENTIAL, USE GROUP R-3, IF THE DWELLING IS:



O e =1 N i B W R ke

W NN R RN NRN DN e e e e e e e e e
= TN R T o S ¥ ) S T - T~ N ~ - R B+ U, S R VL A S

(4)

(5)

(6)

(7

L OWNER OCCUPIED;

11 (OCCUPIED BY MEMBERS OF THE OWNER’S
IMMEDIATE FAMILY; OR

11 OWNER OCCUPIED HAVING NO MORE THAN ONE
ROOMER OR BOARDER.

SuBsEcTION 101.3 INTENT.

DELETE THIS SUBSECTION AN SUBSTITUTE THE FOLLOWING:

101.3 INTENT. THE PURPOSE OF ACTIONS TAKEN BY THE JURISDICTION

PURSUANT TO THIS CODE IS PURELY GOVERNMENTAL IN NATURE AND ARE

CONDUCTED SOLELY FOR THE PUBLIC BENEFIT. ACTIONS TAKEN PURSUANT

TO THIS CODE ARE NOT TO BE CONSTRUED AS PROVIDING ANY WARRANTY

OF CONDITION TO ANY PERSON.

SUBSECTION 101.5 LICENSING.

ADD NEW SUBSECTION 101.5 AFTER SUBSECTION 101.4 AS FOLLOWS:

101.5 LICENSING. A-STRUCTURE WITHIN THE SCOPE OF THIS CODE SHALL

NOT BE OCCUPIED UNLESS THE PROPERTY OWNER OBTAINS THE LICENSE

REQUIRED BY TITLE 14, SUBTITLE 9 OF THE HOWARD COUNTY CODE. THE

PROPERTY OWNER MAY BE SUBJECT TO PENALTIES AND FINES FOR

ILLEGALLY OCCUPYING A PROPERTY WITHOUT A RENTAL LICENSE.

Sussecrion 102,6 HISTORIC BUILDINGS.

DELETE THIS SUBSECTION.

SUBSECTION 102,7 REFERENCED CODES AND STANDARDS,

4] DELETE “CHAPTER 8” AND SUBSTITUTE “THE HOWARD COUNTY
BUILDING CODE AS ADOPTED IN TITLE 3, SUBTITLE 1 OF THE
HOWARD COUNTY CODE, AS APPLICABLE,”,

() AT THE END OF THIS SUBSECTION, INSERT THE FOLLOWING:

102.7.3 BUILDING. WHENEVER THE TERM “INTERNATIONAL
Burpine CODE™ 18 USED IN THIS CODE, IT SHALL MEAN THE
HowARD COUNTY BUILDING CODE ADOPTED PURSUANT TO TITLE 3,

SUBTITLE 1 OF THE HOWARD COUNTY CODE,



WO ~1 Oy th I W R

W W [N . & MNOONONN N R S I e e e — s et e pumd
e e s - e = . T v - P e — @D N e S B W N e <

(8)

)

(10)

102.7.4 ELECTRICAL. WHENEVER THE TERM “ICC ELECTRICAL
(C'ODE” 18 USED IN THIS CODE, IT SHALL MEAN THE HOWARD
COUNTY ELECTRICAL CODE ADOPTED PURSUANT TO TITLE 3,
SUBTITLE 2 OF THE HOWARD COUNTY CODE.
102.7.5 FIRE PREVENTION. WHENEVER THE TERM “INTERNATIONAL
Firrg CODE” 18 USED IN THIS CODE, IT SHALL MEAN THE HOWARD
COUNTY FIRE PREVENTION CODE ADOPTED PURSUANT TO TITLE 17,
SUBTITLE | OF THE HOWARD COUNTY CODE.
102.7.6 PLUMBING AND GASFITTING. WHENEVER THE TERMS
“INTERNATIONAL PLUMBING CODE” OR “INTERNATIONAL FUEL GAS
CODE” ARE USED IN THIS CODE, THEY SHALL MEAN THE HOWARD
COUNTY PLUMBING AND GASFITTING CODE ADOPTED PURSUANT TO
TITLE 3, SUBTITLE 3 OF THE HOWARD COUNTY CODE.
102.7.7 MECHANICAL., WHENEVER THE TERM “INTERNATIONAL
MECHANICAL CODE” 18 USED IN THIS CODE, I'T SHALL MEAN THER
MECHANICAL CopE Or HOWARD COUNTY ADOPTED PURSUANT TO
TITLE 3, SUBTITLE 1 OF THE HOWARD COUNTY CODE.
102.7.8 ZONING, WHENEVER THE TERM “INTERNATIONAL ZONING
CODE” 18 USED IN THIS CODE, 1T SHALL MEAN THE HOWARD
COUNTY ZONING REGULATIONS AS ADOPTED PURSUANT TO TITLE
16 oF THE HOWARD COUNTY CODE.

SECTION 103 DEPARIMENT OF PROPERTY MAINTENANCE INSPECTION.

DELETE THE NAME OF THIS SECTION AND SUBSTITUTE “DEPARTMENT OF

INSPECTIONS, LICENSES AND PERMITS”.

SvBSECTION 103.1 GENERAL.

DELETE THIS SUBSECTION AND SUBSTITUTE THE FOLLOWING:

103.1 GENERAL. THE CODE OFFICIAL IS THE DIRECTOR OF THE

DEPARTMENT OF INSPECTIONS, LICENSES AND PERMITS OR THE DIRECTOR’S

AUTHORIZED DESIGNEE.

SUBSECTION 103.2 APPOINTMENT.

DELETE THIS SUBSECTION.



O e ~1 S b W DN e

W W N RN RN RN R NN NN YR /e e e el Rae e e e
[ oo N NV s S~ TN Y o N I SRR - S U TR NG TR BN« B - S =\ N ¥, T - U VS I & =

(1n
(12)
(13)

(14)

t15)

(16)

Svssecrion 103.3 DEPUTIES.

DELETE THIS SUBSECTION.

SUBSECTION 103.4 LIABILITY.

DELETE THIS SUBSECTION.

SUBSECTION 103.5 FEES.

DELETE THIS SUBSECTION,

SUBSECTION 104.3 RIGHT OF ENTRY.

DELETE THIS SUBSECTION AND SUBSTITUTE THE FOLLOWING:

104.3 Ricar oF ENTRY, 1312 SUBIECT TO TITLE 14, SUBTITLE 9 AND TITLE

17. SUBTITLE 10 oF THE HOowWARD COUNTY CODE, THE CODE OFFICIAL 18

AUTHORIZED TO ENTER A DWELLING UNIT, PROPERTY, OR PREMISES AT
REASONARLE TIMES SOLELY FOR THE PURPOSE OF INSPECTING FOR
COMPLIANCE WITH THIS CODE. IF ENTRY IS REFUSED, THE CODE OFFICIAL
MAY SEEK A COURT ORDER TO PERMIT ENTRY AND FREE ACCESS TO THE
DWELLING UNIT, PROPERTY, OR PREMISES.

SUBSECTION 104.3.1 OCCUPANT OR TENANT 10 GIVE ACCESS.

ADD NEW SUBSECTION 104.3.1 AFTER SUBSECTION 104.3 AS FOLLOWS:
104.3.1 OCCUPANT OR TENANT TO GIVE ACCESS. AN SUBIECT TO TITLE 14,

SUBTITLE 9 AND TITLEL7. SUBTITLE 10 OF THE HOWARD COUNTY CODE,

AN OCCUPANT OR TENANT OF A DWELLING UNIT, PROPERTY, OR PREMISES
SHALL GIVE ACCESS TO ANY PART OF THE DWELLING UNIT, PROPERTY, OR
PREMISES FOR THE PURPOSE OF MAKING INSPECTIONS, MAINTENANCE,
REPAIRS, OR AL TERATIONS AS ARE NECESSARY TO COMPLY WITH THIS CODE.
ACCHSS MUST BE PROVIDED DURING NORMAL BUSINESS HOURS OR AT A
TIME THAT HAS BEEN MUTUALLY AGREED UPON BY BOTH THE LANDLORD
AND THE TENANT.

SUBSECTION 104.3.2 PROPERTY OWNER RIGHT OF ENTRY.

ADD NEW SUBSECTION 104.3.2 AFTER NEW SUBSECTION 104.3.1 AS
FOLLOWS:

104.3,2 PROPERTY OWNER RIGHT OF ENTRY, FHE SUBIECT TO TITLE 14,

SUBTITLE 9 AND TITLEL 7, SUBTITLE 10 OF THE HOWARD COUNTY CODE,




[C T S S NS SR S P S N

L2 L b o (o) o b2 b - I N o — e — — — — — p— —
e V= T S . & S R = =~ - . B = O o L e ==

(17

(18)

(19)

THE PROPERTY OWNER SHALL GIVE THE TENANT OR OCCUPANT AT LEAST '
24-HOURS WRITTEN OR VERBAL NOTICE PRIOR TO ENTRY FOR REPAIRS,
EXCEPTION: EMERGENCY SITUATIONS.

SuBsEcTIioN 106.1 UNLAWFUL ACTS.

DELETE THIS SUBSECTION AND SUBSTITUTE THE FOLLOWING!

106.1 UNLAWFUL ACTS. AN OWNER, OCCUPANT, OR TENANT SHALL NOT
ERECT, CONSTRUCT, ALTER, EXTEND, REPAIR, REMOVE, DEMOLISH,
MAINTAIN, FAIL TO MAINTAH\i, PROVIDE, FAIL TO PROVIDE, OCCUPY, PERMIT
ANOTHER PERSON TO OCCUPY ANY PREMISES, PROPERTY, DWELLING UNIT,
OR EQUIPMENT REGULATED BY THIS CODE, OR CAUSE THE SAME TO BE DONE
IN VIOLATION OF ANY OF THE PROVISIONS OF THIS CODE; FAIL TO OBEY A
LAWFUL ORDER OF THE CODE OFFICIAL; OR REMOVE OR DEFACE A PLACARD
OR NOTICE POSTED UNDER A PROVISION OF THIS CODE.

SUBSECTION 106.3 PROSECUTION OF VIOLATION.

DELETE THIS SUBSECTION, RENAME, AND SUBSTITUTE THE FOLLOWING:
106.3 ENFORCEMENT AND PENALTIES. A PERSON WHO VIOLATES A
PROVISION OF THIS CODE IS GUILTY OF A MISDEMEANOR AND, UPON
CONVICTION, IS SUBJECT TO A FINE, NOT EXCEEDING $1,000, OR
IMPRISONMENT, NOT EXCEEDING 30 DAYS, OR BOTH. ALTERNATIVELY, AND
IN ADDITION TO AND CONCURRENT WITH ALL OTHER REMEDIES AT LAW OR
AT BQUITY, THE DEPARTMENT OF INSPECTIONS, LICENSES AND PERMITS
MAY ENFORCE THIS CODE WITH CIVIL PENALTIES AS PROVIDED IN TITLE 24
“CIVIL, PENALTIES” OF THE HOWARD COUNTY CODE. A VIOLATION OF THIS
SUBTITLE IS A CLASS B OFFENSE. EACH DAY THAT A VIOLATION CONTINUES
IS A SEPARATE OFFENSE.

SUBSECTION 106.4 VIOLATION PENALTIES.

DELETE THIS SUBSECTION, RENAME, AND SUBSTITUTE THE FOLLOWING!:
106.4 REvocATION, THE DIRECTOR OF THE DEPARTMENT OF INSPECTIONS,
LICENSES AND PERMITS MAY SUSPEND, REVOKE, OR REFUSE TO RENEW A
RENTAL HOUSING LICENSE IF THE CODE OFFICIAL FINDS THAT AN OWNER OF

A PROPERTY HAS VIOLATED A PROVISION OF THIS CODE, THIS TITLE, OR



(= N - LY, NS U PURN N S

WM MR R R R R R R R e —m o e e
L o+ = L e = L P A == TN o R - BT [ < AN 7 T VO O R N e o

(20)

ey

(22)

(23)

(24)

REGULATIONS THAT IMPLEMENT THIS TITLE IN CONNECTION WITH THE

CONSTRUCTION, MAINTENANCE, ALTERATION, OR REPAIR OF A PREMISES,

PROPERTY, DWELLING UNIT, EQUIPMENT, OR LLAND WITHIN HOWARD

CoUNTY. THE DIRECTOR MAY REVOKE A RENTAL HOUSING LICENSE IF IT IS

DISCOVERED THAT THE OWNER OR APPLICANT MISREPRESENTED

THEMSELVES OR FALSIFIED RECORDS RELATING TO THE LICENSE, ANB/OR

HAS BEENISSUED-MULTIPLE NOTICES OF VIOLATIONS AND/OR-CIEATIONS-

SUBSECTION 106.5 ABATEMENT OF VIOLATION.

DELETE THIS SUBSECTION.

SUBSECTION 107.2 FORM,

D ITEM 4, AFTER “DWELLING UNIT OR” DELETE “STRUCTURE” AND
SUBSTITUTE “PREMISES”.

(1) DELETE ITEMS 5 AND 6.

SUBSECTION 107.5. PENALTIES.

DELETE “106.4” AND SUBSTITUTE “106.3”,

SUBSECTION 108.1.5 DANGEROUS STRUCTURE OR PREMISES.

DELETE ITEM 11,

SUBSECTION 108.2 CLOSING OF VACANT STRUCTURES.

] IN THE TITLE DELETE “CLOSING OF” AND SUBSTITUTE “SECURING”.

()  IN'THE FIRST AND SECOND SENTENCE, DELETE “CLOSE UP” AND
SUBSTITUTE “SECURE AGAINST CASUAL ENTRY”,

() IN THE SECOND SENTENCE, DELETE “CLOSED AND”,

(1v)  INTHE SECOND SENTENCE, AFTER “PRIVATE PERSONS”, INSERT A
PERIOD AND DELETE THE REMAINDER OF THIS SECTION;

(V)  AFTER “PERSONS.” INSERT “THE OWNER IS RESPONSIBLE FOR
REIMBURSING THE COUNTY FOR THE COST OF NECESSARY REPAIRS,
‘THE DIRECTOR OF FINANCE SHALL BILL THE OWNER FOR THE COST
OF THE WORK. THE OWNER SHALL PAY THE BILL FOR THE WORK
WITHIN 30 DAYS OF BILLING. IF THE OWNER DOES NOT PAY THE BILL

WITHIN 30 DAYS, THE CODE OFFICIAL MAY SEEK A COURT ORDER



SN e~y o B W N

L T L e - L e = o e e e e
o= N S~ BN, S N 1 SO o P A T e Ve B~ I = T ¥ s N o o

(25)

(26)

27)

(28)

29

REQUIRING THE OWNER TO REIMBURSE THE COUNTY FOR THE COST
OF REPAIRS.”
(vi)  DELETE SUBSECTION 108.2.1.
SUBSECTION 108.4 PLACARDING.
IN THE FIRST SENTENCE, DELETE “BEARING” THROUGH THE END OF THE
SENTENCE AND SUBSTITUTE THE FOLLOWING:
BEARTNG THE PHRASE “UNLICENSED PREMISES, UNLAWFUL TO OCCUPY ANY
CURRENTLY VACANT DWELLING UNIT IN THESE PREMISES OR ANY DWELLING
UNIT BECOMING VACANT UNTIL A RENTAL HOUSING LICENSE HAS BEEN
OBTAINED,”.
SUBSECTION 109.4 EMERGENCY REPAIRS.
ADD THE FOLLOWING TO THE END OF THIS SUBSECTION:
THE OWNER IS RESPONSIBLE FOR REIMBURSING THE COUNTY FOR THE COST
OF NECESSARY REPAIRS. THE DIRECTOR OF FINANCE SHALL BILL THE
OWNER FOR THE COST OF THE WORK. THE OWNER SHALL PAY THE BILL FOR
THE WORK WITHIN 30 DAYS OF BILLING. IF THE OWNER DOES NOT PAY THE
BILL WITHIN 30 DAYS, THE CODE OFFICIAL MAY SEEK A COURT ORDER
REQUIRING THE OWNER TO REIMBURSE THE COUNTY FOR THE COST OF
REPAIRS.
SusecTion 109.5 Costs oF EMERGENCY REPAIRS.
DELETE THIS SUBSECTION.
SUBSECTION 109.6 HEARING.
DELETE THE SECOND SENTENCE AND SUBSTITUTE THE FOLLOWING:
A PERSON MAY APPEAL AN ORDER TO TAKE EMERGENCY MEASURES TO A
HEARING EXAMINER OF THE HOWARD COUNTY BOARD OF APPEALS IN
ACCORDANCE WITH THE RULES OF PROCEDURE SET FORTH IN TITLE 16,
SUBTITLE 3 oF THE HowARD COUNTY CODE.
SvuBSECTION 110.3 FAILURE TO COMPLY.
D AFTER “PRIVATE PERSONS™:
A. DELETE THE COMMA AND INSERT A PERIOD; AND

B. DELETE THE REMAINDER OF THE SECTION AFTER “PERSONS.”



e S

o o0 -1 &N U

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25
26
27
28
29
30
31

(30)

(1)

(32)

uy

AFTER “PERSONS.” INSERT THE FOLLOWING:

“THE OWNER IS RESPONSIBLE FOR REIMBURSING THE COUNTY FOR
THE COST OF NECESSARY REPAIRS, THE DIRECTOR OF FINANCE
SHALY BILL THE OWNER FOR THE COST OF THE WORK. THE OWNER
SHALL PAY THE BILL FOR THE WORK WITHIN 30 DAYS OF BILLING. IF
THE OWNER DOES NOT PAY THE BILL WITHIN 30 DAYS, THE CODE
OFFICTAL MAY SEEK A COURT ORDER REQUIRING THE OWNER TO
REIMBURSE THE COUNTY FOR THE COST OF REPAIRS.”

SECTION 111 MEANS OF APPEAL.

DELETE THIS SECTION IN ITS ENTIRETY.

SEcrion 112 Stop Work ORDER.

DELETE THIS SECTION IN ITS ENTIRETY.

SECTION 202 GENERAL DEFINITIONS,

®

ay

DELETE THE DEFINITION FOR “DWELLING UNIT” AND SUBSTITUTE
THE FOLLOWING:

[BG] DWELLING UNIT. A BUILDING, STRUCTURE, OR ANY PORTION
OF A BUILDING OR STRUCTURE THAT CONTAINS A SINGLE UNIT
PROVIDING INDEPENDENT LIVING FACILITIES FOR ONE OR MORE
PERSONS, INCLUDING PERMANENT PROVISIONS FOR LIVING, EATING,
COOKING, SANITATION OR SLEEPING. A DWELLING UNIT SHALL
INCLUDE, WITHOUT LIMITATION, A MULTI-FAMILY HOUSE, SINGLE-
FAMILY HOUSE, APARTMENT, APARTMENT HOUSE, BOARDING HOUSE,
ROOMING HOUSE, DORMITORY, ROOMING UNIT, EFFICIENCY UNIT,
HOTEL, MOTEL, OR A MULTI-FAMILY DWELLING OWNED BY A SINGLE
OWNER,

DELETE THE DEFINITION FOR “OWNER” AND SUBSTITUTE THE
FOLLOWING:

[A] OWNER. A PERSON, AGENT, OPERATOR, FIRM, OR CORPORATION
HAVING A LEGAL OR EQUITABLE INTEREST IN THE DWELLING UNIT;
HOLDING RECORDED TITLE IN THE OFFICIAL RECORDS OF THE STATE

3

COUNTY, OR MUNICIPALITY, OR JOINTLY OR SEVERALLY HAVING



o B = ¥ e - N

L N T e T o T o o o o L o T o T o T T T e e T S S S
[ N & B I L = A S ¥ L N ¥ =T B - - B B~ A ) S R v o e =]

(33)

(34)

(33)

(36)

37

CONTROL OF THE PROPERTY, INCLUDING, WITHOUT LIMITATION, AN
EXECUTOR, ADMINISTRATOR, TRUSTEE, RECEIVER, GUARDIAN, OR
OTHERREmumENTAHVEApmmNTEDACCORDD«}TOLAWQANDTHE
SENIOR OFFICER, DIRECTOR, OR TRUSTEE OF THE ASSOCIATION OF
UNIT OWNERS OF A CONDOMINIUM.
(III)  ADD THE FOLLOWING ALPHABETICALLY WITHIN THIS SECTION:
A. NORMAL BUSINESS HOURS. 9:00 A.M. TO 5:00 P.M.
B. SANITARY CONDITION, PROMOTING HEALTH AND
HEALTHFUL LIVING CONDITIONS BY THE ELIMINATION OF
DIRT, FECES, URINE, GARBAGE AND RUBBISH.
SUBSECTION 302,4 WEEDS,
INSERT “12 INCHES” WHERE INDICATED.
SUBSECTION 302.4.1 BUSHES AND SHRUBS.
ADD NEW SUBSECTION 302.4.1 AFTER SUBSECTION 302.4 AS FOLLOWS:
302.4.1 BUSHES AND SHRUBS. BUSHES AND/OR SHRUBS SHALL NOT BLOCK
OR INTERFERE WITH INGRESS OR EGRESS. EOLHAGEMAYNOT-EXEEED-6
INCHES-ABOVE-ANY-WINDOW-SILL-OR-BE-LOCATED- WATHN-12-INCHES-OF
AN ENTER—OR-WINDOW FACGE:
SUBSECTION 302.4.2 TREES AND BRANCHES.
ADD NEW SUBSECTION 302.4.2 AFTER NEW SUBSECTION 302.4.1 AS
FOLLOWS:
302.4.2 TREES AND BRANCHES. IF, IN THE OPINION OF THE CODE OFFICIAL,
DEAD OR DISEASED TREES AND BRANCHES PRESENT A HAZARD TO PERSONS
OR PROPERTY, THOSE TREES AND/OR BRANCHES SHALL BE REMOVED,
SUBSECTION 302.5 RODENT HARBORAGE.
IN THE SECOND SENTENCE, DELETE “EXTERMINATED” AND SUBSTITUTE
“ELIMINATED”.
SUBSECTION 304.3.1 PREMISES IDENTIFICATION FOR APARTMENTS AND
CoNDO UNITS.
ADD NEW SUBSECTION 304.3.1 AFTER SECTION 304.3 AS FOLLOWS:

10



—

[ o8] | N B e R o B o T e e R R R e e

A o B I T = S O, S = UL B o ]

(38)

(39)

(40)

(41)

(42)

(43)

(44)

304.3.1 PREMISES IDENTIFICATION FOR APARTMENTS AND CONDO UNITS.
CONDO AND APARTMENT UNITS SHALL HAVE UNIT NUMBERS POSTED ON
EXTERIOR DOORS TO UNIT.

SUBSECTION 304.14 INSECT SCREENS.

DELETE “DURING THE PERIOD FROM [DATE] TO [DATE],”.

SvuBsecTioN 305.1.1 UNSAFE CONDITIONS.

DELETE THIS SECTION IN ITS ENTIRETY.

SUBSECTION 305.3.1 LEAD-BASED PAINT.

ADD NEW SUBSECTION 305.3.1 AFTER SUBSECTION 305.3 AS FOLLOWS:

305.3.1. LEAD-BASED PAINT. 'THE OWNER OF A DWELLING UNIT SHALL

COMPLY WITH REQUIREMENTS OF THE MARYLAND IDEPARTMENT OF THE

ENVIRONMENT FOR LEAD-BASED PAINT AND SHALL PROVIDE THE REQUIRED

DISCLOSURES IN ACCORDANCE WITH STATE LAW. A COPY OF THE MDE

LEAD CERTIFICATION MUST BE PROVIDED TO THE LOCAL JURISDICTION,

SUBSECTION 307.1 GENERAL.

IN THE FIRST SENTENCE, DELETE “MORE THAN FOUR RISERS” AND

SUBSTITUTE “FOUR OR MORE RISERS”,

SUBSECTION 308.2.1 RUBBISH STORAGE FACILITIES.

D DELETE THE TITLE OF THIS SECTION AND SUBSTITUTE “RUBBISH AND
RECYCLING STORAGE FACILITIES™.

() AT THE END OF THIS SUBSECTION, AFTER “RUBBISH.” INSERT:!
EXCEPTION: THE OCCUPANT OF A ONE-FAMILY DWELLING SHALL BE
RESPONSIBLE FOR THE SAFE AND SANITARY STORAGE AND REMOVAL
OF ALL RUBBISH AND RECYCLABLES,

SUBSECTION 308.3.1 GARBAGE FACILITIES.

ADD THE FOLLOWING AT THE END OF THIS SUBSECTION:

EXCEPTION: THE OCCUPANT OF A ONE-FAMILY DWELLING SHALL BE

RESPONSIBLE FOR THE SAFE AND SANITARY STORAGE AND REMOVAL OF ALL

GARBAGE.

SUBSECTION 309.1 INFESTATION.

11



[T S N I L <. T ¥, B - VL o

L T 0 T N T o L o N L R o L L A T e e e e R S o S S
En S - AN o S - L B I S O I L VS o =Tt B - - B S N = R S 'S o

(45)

(46)

(47

(48)

(49)

(50)

1

(52)

N IN THE FIRST SENTENCE DELETE “INSECT” AND SUBSTITUTE “INSECT,
VERMIN,”.

(1) IN THE SECOND SENTENCE:

A, DELETE “INSECTS” AND SUBSTITUTE “INSECTS, VERMIN,”;
AND
B, DELETE “EXTERMINATED BY APPROVED PROCESSES” AND

SUBSTITUTE “ELIMINATED BY A PROCESS APPROVED BY THE
DEPARTMENT OF INSPECTIONS, LICENSES AND PERMITS”.
SUBSECTION 309.1.1 WILDLIFE AND PROTECTED SPECIES.
ADD NEW SUBSECTION 309.1.1 AFTER SUBSECTION 309.1 AS FOLLOWS:
SUBSECTION 309.1.1 WILDLIFE AND PROTECTED SPECIES. WILDLIFE SHALL
BE HANDLED IN ACCORDANCE WITH STATE AND FEDERAL GUIDELINES,
SUBSECTION 309.1.2 OCCUPANT RESPONSIBILITY.
ADD NEW SUBSECTION 309,1.2 AFTER NEW SUBSECTION 309.1.1 A8
FOLLOWS:
SUBSECTION 309.1.2 OCCUPANT RESPONSIBILITY, THE OCCUPANT SHALL
PREPARE THEIR DWELLING UNIT FOR PEST CONTROL TREATMENT AS
NECESSARY.
SUBSECTION 309.2 OWNER.
DELETE “PRIOR TO RENTING OR LEASING THE STRUCTURE”,
SUBSECTION 309.3 SINGLE OCCUPANT.
DELETE THIS SUBSECTION.
SUBSECTION 309.4 MULTIPLE OCCUPANCY.
DELETE THIS SUBSECTION.
SUBSECTION 309.5 OCCUPANT.
DELETE THIS SUBSECTION.
SUBSECTION 403.5 CLOTHES DRYER EXHAUST.
AT THE END OF THE PARAGRAPH, AFTER “INSTRUCTIONS” ADD “AND LOCAL
ADOPTED MECHANICAL CODES”,
SUBSECTION 403.5.1 DRYER VENTING TRANSITION DUCTS.

ADD NEW SUBSECTION 403.5.1 AFTER SUBSECTION 403.5 AS FOLLOWS:

12



N R e = T ¥, S - N VL - e L

W W MR B B ms e e et e e et fed ek fed

(53)

(54)

(55)

(56)

(57

403.5.1 DRYER VENTING TRANSITION DUCTS. TRANSITION DUCTS USED TO
CONNECT THE DRYER TO THE EXHAUST DUCT SYSTEM SHALL BE A SINGLE
LENGTH THAT IS LISTED AND LABELED IN ACCORDANCE WITH UL 2158A.
TRANSITION DUCTS SHALL BE A MAXIMUM OF 8 FEET (2438 MM) IN LENGTH
AND SHALL NOT BE CONCEALED WITHIN CONSTRUCTION.

SUBSECTION 404.1 PRIVACY.

AT THE BEGINNING OF THE SENTENCE, DELETE “DWELLING UNITS” AND
SUBSTITUTE “SLEEPING ROOMS WITHIN DWELLING UNITS”.

SUBSECTION 404.8 LOCATION OF FOOD PREPARATION EQUIPMENT.

ADD NEW SUBSECTION 404.8 AFTER SUBSECTION 404.7 AS FOLLOWS:

404,8 LOCATION OF FOOD PREPARATION EQUIPMENT. A PERSON SHALL
NOT USE PORTABLE COOKING EQUIPMENT INCLUDING, BUT NOT LIMITED TO,
A BARBEQUE, CHARCOAL OR PROPANE GRILL, OR STOVE INSIDE OR WITHIN
15 FEET OF A MULTIFAMILY DWELLING.

SUBSECTION 503.4 FLOOR SURFACE,

DELETE “IN OTHER THAN DWELLING UNITS, EVERY” AND SUBSTITUTE
“EVERY”,

SUBSECTION 505.2.1 WATER POTABILITY.

ADD NEW SUBSECTION 505.2.1 AFTER SUBSECTION 505.2 AS FOLLOWS:
505.2.1 WATER POTABILITY: IN ORDER TO BECOME LICENSED OR RENEW A
LICENSE, OWNERS OF PROPERTIES ON PRIVATE WATER SYSTEMS MUST
PROVIDE THE CODE OFFICIAL WITH A LEGIBLE COPY OF A PASSING WELL
POTABILITY TEST THAT IS NO MORE THAN 4 YEARS OLD. RESULTS MUST BE
IN CONFORMANCE WITH EXISTING COMAR (CODE OF MARYLAND
REGULATIONS) STANDARDS. '

SUBSECTION 505.3 SUPPLY.

AT THE END OF THE SENTENCE, DELETE “DEFECTS AND LEAKS” AND
SUBSTITUTE “CONTAMINATION, DEFECTS, AND LEAKS,”
SUBSECTION-S 054 ATERHEATING - FACH RS

(13 k)

113 3y
O

13



OO ~3 oy w1 B Wby —

(FCTR VE R N S T S TS - S T N S N S N S N5 TR N SO GO S S
—_ S WU e ) Ohn L R W R o— O W e =1 N i B W RN e O

BN(SR)SUBSECTION 506.4 SEWAGE BACKUP,
ADD NEW SUBSECTION 506.4 AFTER SUBSECTION 506.3 AS FOLLOWS:
506.4 SEWAGE BACKUP. IN THE EVENT OF A SEWAGE BACKUP, THE OWNER
SHALL BE REQUIRED TO IMMEDIATELY RESTORE THE PREMISES TO A CLEAN
AND SANITARY CONDITION BY A PROCESS APPROVED BY THE DEPARTMENT
OF INSPRCTIONS, LICENSES AND PERMITS.

L6D{(5NSUBSECTION 602.2 RESIDENTIAL OCCUPANCIES.
DELETE THE SUBSECTION AND REPLACE WITH THE FOLLOWING:
602.2 RESIDENTIAL OCCUPANCIES. DWELLINGS SHALL BE PROVIDED WITH
HEATING FACILITIES THAT ARE CONTINUCUSLY MAINTAINED, IN GOOD
WORKING ORDER, AND CAPABLE OF MAINTAINING A ROOM TEMPERATURE
OF 68 DEGREES F (20 DEGREES C) IN ALL HABITABLE ROOMS, BATHROOMS,
AND TOILET ROOMS BASED ON THE WINTER OUTDOOR DESIGN TEMPERATURE
FOR THE LOCALITY, COOKING APPLIANCES SHALL NOT BE USED, NOR
SHALL PORTABLE UNVENTED FUEL-BURNING SPACE HEATERS USED, AS A
MEANS TO PROVIDE HEATING TO MEET THE REQUIREMENTS OF THE SECTION.
EXCEPTION: IN AREAS WHERE THE AVERAGE MONTHLY TEMPERATURE IS
ABOVE 30 DEGREES F (-1 C), A MINIMUM TEMPERATURE OF 65 DEGREES F
(18 DEGREES C) SHALL BE MAINTAINED,

6D(60)SUBSECTION 602.3 HEAT SUPPLY.
(0 IN THE FIRST SENTENCE, DELETE “[DATE] TO [DATE{” AND

SUBSTITUTE “OCTOBER 1 TO MAY 17} AND

(1)  INEXCEPTION #1, DELETE THE SECOND SENTENCE,

62)(61)SUBSECTION 602.4 OCCUPIABLE WORK SPACES.
DELETE “[DATE] TO [DATE]” AND SUBSTITUTE “OCTOBER 1 TO MAY 17,

633(62)SUBSECTION 603.2 REMOVAL OF COMBUSTION PRODUCTS.
ADD THE FOLLOWING AS THE SECOND EXCEPTION TO THIS SUBSECTION:
EXCEPTION NUMBER 2: PORTABLE UNVENTED KEROSENE HEATERS ARE NOT
PERMITTED.

(64)(63)SUBSECTION 604.4 ELECTRICAL PANEL CLEARANCES.

ADD NEW SUBSECTION 604.4 AFTER SUBSECTION 604.3.2.1 AS FOLLOWS:

14



R o e T LS S

[ B %] | T s N o o T L o T e e e T S

604.4 ELECTRICAL PANEL CLEARANCES. A-WORKING-SPACE-OFNOTLESS

SPACE: MATERIALS SHALL NOT BE STORED IN A MANNER THAT OBSTRUCTS

THE ELECTRICAL PANEL OR OTHERWISE CREATES A HAZARD. A CLEAR

UNOBSTRUCTED PATH TO THE ELECTRICAI PANEL MUST BE MAINTAINED.
65)(64)SUBSECTION 605.2.1 PAINTED RECEPTACLES.
ADD NEW SUBSECTION 605.2.1 AFTER SUBSECTION 605.2 AS FOLLOWS:
605.2.1 PAINTED RECEPTACLES. PAINTED ELECTRICAL RECEPTACLES
{OUTLETS) CANNOT BE CLEANED AND MUST BE REPLACED.
€66)(65)SUBSECTION 605.3 LUMINAIRES.
AFTER “EVERY” INSERT “EXTERIOR EXIT,”.
6 N(66)SUBSECTION 607.1 GENERAL,
AFTER “MAINTAINED”, INSERT “IN GOOD CONDITION”.
(68)(6T)SUBSECTION 701,3 TESTING AND MAINTENANCE.
ADD NEW SUBSECTION 701.3 AFTER SUBSECTION 701.2 AS FOLLOWS:
701.3 TESTING AND MAINTENANCE. SPRINKLER SYSTEMS SHALL BE
INSPECTED AT LEAST ANNUALLY BY A MARYLAND STATE LICENSED
SPRINKLER CONTRACTOR. FIRE ALARM SYSTEMS SHALL BE INSPECTED AT
LEAST ANNUALLY BY AN APPROVED COMPANY OR INDIVIDUAL. INSPECTION
REPORTS AND DEFICIENCY CORRECTION REPORTS MUST BE PROVIDED
ANNUALLY TO THE CODE OFFICIAL,
£69(68)SuBSECTION 702,1.1 EMERGENCY PLANNING,
ADD NEW SUBSECTION 702.1.1 AFTER SUBSECTION 702.1 AS FOLLOWS:
702.1.1 EMERGENCY PLANNING. THE ADMINISTRATION OF EVERY
RESIDENTIAL CARE FACILITY OR ASSISTED LIVING FACILITY SHALL HAVE A

PLAN IN EFFECT TO PROTECT INDIVIDUALS IN THE EVENT OF A FIRE. THE

15



Lo I e L A 7. T _ N 8

[ T N S N T o R o T o L o o e o e e e T T R Y T S ]
e N o T + R O T S o - T v B - B e R R " o e e

PLAN SHALL BE IN WRITING AND SHALL BE AVAILABLE TO ALL SUPERVISORY
PERSONNEL. THE PLAN SHALL BE AMENDED TO ENSURE THE SAFETY OF ALL
RESIDENTS AND SHALL BE AMENDED OR REVISED AS THE RESIDENTS OR
THEIR NEEDS CHANGE. STAFF SHALL BE INSTRUCTED OF THEIR DUTIES AND
RESPONSIBILITIES UNDER THE PLAN AND A RECORD OF SUCH INSTRUCTIONS
SHALL BE MAINTAINED. A COPY OF THE PLAN SHALL BE READILY
AVAILABLE AT ALL TIMES WITHIN THE FACILITY.

R(6NSuBSECTION 702.5 ARRANGEMENT.
ADD NEW SUBSECTION 702.5 AFTER SUBSECTION 702.4 AS FOLLOWS:!
702.5 ARRANGEMENT. THE REQUIRED PATH OR TRAVEL FROM ANY ROOM
SHALL NOT BE THROUGH ANOTHER ROOM THAT IS NOT UNDER THE
IMMEDIATE CONTROL OF THE OCCUPANT OF THE FIRST ROOM OR THROUGH A
BATHROOM OR OTHER SPACE SUBJECT TO LOCKING.

ED(I0SUBSECTION 704.2.3. TAMPERING.
ADD NEW SUBSECTION 704.2.3 AFTER SUBSECTION 704.2.2 AS FOLLOWS:
704.2.3, TAMPERING. ANY TENANT OR OCCUPANT TAMPERING OR
INTERFERING WITH THE EFFECTIVENESS OF A SMOKE DETECTOR IS IN
VIOLATION OF THIS CODE.

2(71)SUBSECTION 704.6.1 WHERE REQUIRED.
DELETE EXCEPTION #2 AND RENUMBER EXCEPTION #3 TO BE EXCEPTION #2.

E(T2)SUBSECTION 704.8 SPRINKLERS.
ADD NEW SUBSECTION 704.8 AFTER SUBSECTION 704.7 AS FOLLOWS:
704.7 SPRINKLERS. SPRINKLERS SHALL BE CLEAN AND FREE FROM
CORROSION, PAINT, AND DAMAGE. KITCHEN SUPPLIES OR STORAGE STOCK
SHALL BE AT LEAST 18 INCHES BELOW SPRINKLER DEFLECTORS.

45 (73)SECITION 706 STORAGE OF HAZARDOUS MATERIALS.
ADD NEW SECTION 706 AFTER SECTION 705 AS FOLLOWS:
706 STORAGE OF HAZARDOUS MATERIALS.
706.1 HAZARDOUS MATERIALS., UNLESS STORAGE COMPLIES WITH THE

APPLICABLE REQUIREMENTS OF THE HOWARD COUNTY BUILDING CODE

16



[ B o T L o O o S T

| o T O N O | S S N T e e e e e e = T =

AND THE HOWARD COUNTY FIRE PREVENTION CODE, A PERSON SHALL NOT

STORE OR ACCUMULATE:

(0 COMBUSTIBLE, FLAMMARLE, EXPLOSIVE, OR OTHER HAZARDOUS
MATERIALS, SUCH AS PAINTS, VOLATILE OILS, OR CLEANING FLUIDS;
OR

()  COMBUSTIBLE RUBBISH, SUCH AS WASTEPAPER, BOXES AND RAGS.

706.2 STORAGE OF VEHICLES THAT CONTAIN HAZARDOUS MATERIALS. IN

A COMMON AREA OF A MULTI-FAMILY DWELLING OWN’éD BY ONE PERSON,

PATIO, BALCONY, HALLWAY, OR STAIRWEL], OF A STRUCTURE OR PREMISES,

A PERSON SHALL NOT STORE OR ACCUMULATE A MOTORCYCLE, MOPED,

GASOLINE-POWERED LAWNMOWER, OR OTHER SIMILAR EQUIPMENT THAT

MAY CONTAIN A HAZARDOUS MATERIAL INCLUDING, WITHOUT LIMITATION,

GASOLINE.

706.3 STORAGE OF ITEMS AND EQUIPMENT IN MULTI-FAMILY DWELLINGS,

HOTELS/MOTELS, ALY AREAS OF EGRESS, COMMON TRAVEL AND REFUGE

SHALL BE FREE OF STORAGE, FURNISHINGS, DECORATIONS AND/OR

OBSTRUCTIONS.

706.4 STORAGE IN SPRINKLER EQUIPMENT ROOMS. SPRINKLER

EQUIPMENT ROOMS MAY NOT BE USED AS STORAGE ROOMS.

706.5 STORAGE AND USE OF OPEN FIAME/FUEL FIRED EQUIPMENT. A

PERSON SHALL NOT USE OR STORE OPEN FLAME/FUEL FIRED EQUIPMENT

INSIDE OR WITHIN 15 FEET OF A MULTI-FAMILY DWELLING.

5 (J4)DELETE APPENDIX A, BOARDING STANDARD, IN ITS ENTIRETY.

Title 14. Licenses, inspections and permits.

Subtitle 9. Rental housing license.

Section 14.900, Definitions.

In this subtitle the following terms have the meanings indicated.,

17



(- R S L

() “Howard County Property Maintenance Code for Rental Housing” means the
International Property Maintenance Code, [[2006]] 2018 Edition, as adopted in Title 3,
Subtitle 7 of the Howard County Code.

Section 2. And Be It Further Enacted by the County Council of Howard County,
Maryland, that this Act shall become effective 61 days after its enactment.

18



BY THE COUNCIL

This Bill, having been approved by the Executive and returned to the Council, stands enacted on

YWes | , 2019
Q

Jessicg/Feldmark, Administrator to the County Council

BY THE COUNCIL

This Bill, having been passed by the yeas and nays of two-thirds of the members of the Council notwithstanding the
objections of the Executive, stands enacted on , 2019,

Jessica Feldmark, Administrator fo the County Council

BY THE COUNCIL

This Bill, having received neither the approval nor the disapproval of the Executive within ten days of its
presentation, stands enacted on , 2019,

Jessica Feldmark, Administrator to the County Council

BY THE COUNCIL

This Bill, not having been considered on final reading within the time required by Charter, stands failed for want of
consideration on , 2019,

Jessica Feldmark, Adminisirator to the County Council

BY THE COUNCIL

This Bill, having been disapproved by the Executive and having failed on passage upon consideration by the
Council stands failed on , 2019,

Jessica Feldmark, Administrator to the County Council

BY THE COUNCIL

This Bill, the withdrawal of which received a vote of two-thirds (2/3) of the members of the Council, is withdrawn
from further consideration on , 2019,

Jessica Feldmark, Administrator to the County Council



(o B« I ~> T ¥ B - N O SR S

[ - T = = T = S = S S SE N
[« TR W s N ¥ E S 7 N S O O o

Amendment ____L to Council Bill No. 15-2019

BY: The Chairperson at the request Legislative Day Lo
of the County Executive Date: May 6,2019

Amendment No. i

(This amendment:

1. Ensures that landlord tenant provisions related to rights of entry that are contained elsewhere
in the Code are applied;

2. Removes redundant authority related to the revocation of a license;

3. Allows for more discretion related to the removal of shrubs and bushes and clavifies that only
bushes and shrubs that impede egress and ingress are regulated;

4. Allows for more discretion related to the determination of the adequacy of hot water; and

5. Prohibits, generally, storage around an electrical panel and requires a clear, unobstructed
path to an electrical panel.)

On page 5, in line 9, strike “I'BE” and substitute “SUBJECT TQ TITLE 14, SUBTITLE 9 AND TITLE

17. SUBTITLE 10 oF THE HOWARD COUNTY CODE, THE”.

On page 5, in line 17, strike “AN” and substitute “SUBJECT TO TiTLE 14, SUBTITLE 9 AND

TItLE17. SUBTITLE 10 OF THE HOWARD COUNTY CODE, AN”.

On page 5, in line 27, sirike “THE” and substitute “SUBJECT TO TITLE 14, SUBTITLE 9 AND

TITLEL7, SUBTITLE 10 OF THE HOWARD COUNTY CODE, THE”.

On page 7, in line 3, strike “AND/OR” and substitute a period.
On page 7, strike line 4.

On page 10, strike beginning with “FOLIAGE” in line 13 down through and including “FACE.” in

fline 15.

On page 13, strike lines 24 through 26, inclusive and in their entirety.



19
20
21
22
23
24
25
26
27
28
29
30
31
32
33
34
35
36
37
38
39
40
41
42
43
44
45
46
47
48
49
50
51

On page 13, in line 27, strike “(59)” and substitute “(58)”.

On page 14, in line 3, strike “(60)” and substitute “(59)”.

On page 14, in line 16, strike “(61)” and substitute “(60)”.

On page 14, in line 20, strike “(62)” and substitute “(61)”.

On page 14, in line 22, strike “(63)” and substitute “(62)”.

On page 14, in line 26, strike “(64)” and substitute “(63)”.

Strike beginning with “A” on page 14, in line 28 down through and including “SPACE.” on page

15, in line 4 and substitute “MATERIALS SHALL NOT BE STORED IN A MANNER THAT OBSTRUCTS

THE ELECTRICAL PANEL OR OTHERWISE CREATES A HAZARD.”.

On page 15, in line 6, strike “(65)” and substitute “(64)”.

On page 15, in line 10, strike “(66)” and substitute “(65)”.

On page 15, in line 12, strike “(67)” and substitute “(66)”.

On page 15, in line 14, strike “(68)” and substitute “(67)".

On page 15, in line 22, strike “(69)” and substitute “(68)”.

On page 16, in line 3, strike “(70)” and substitute “(69)"

On page 16, in line 9, strike “(71)” and substitute “(70)”.

On page 16, in line 14, strike “(72)” and substitute “(71)”.

On page 16, in line 16, strike “(73)” and substitute “(72)".
2



52
53
54
55

On page 16, in line 21, strike “(74)” and substitute “(73)".

On page 17, in line 17, strike “(75)” and substituie “(74)”.




102.7.4 ELECTRICAL. WHENEVER THE TERM “JCC ELECTRICAL

—

2 CODE” 1S USED IN THIS CODE, iT SHALL MEAN THE HOWARD .-
3 COUNTY ELECTRICAL CODE ADOPTED PURSUANT TO TITLE 3,
4 SUBTITLE 2 OF THE HOWARD COUNTY CODE. L e
5 102.7.5 FIRE PREVENTION, WHENEVER THE TERM “Iﬁfﬁ:RNA TIONAL
6 FIRE CODE” 18 USED IN THIS CODE, IT SHALL MEAN THE HOWARD
7 CoUNTY FIRE PREVENTION CODE ADOPTED PURSUANT TO TITLE 17,
8 SUBTITLE 1 OF THE HOWARD COUNTY CODE
9 102.7.6 PLUMBING AND GASFITTING. ‘WHENEVER THE TERMS
10 “INTERNATIONAL PLUMBING CODE” oR “INTERNATIONAL FUEL GAS
11 CODE”™ ARE USED IN THIS CODE' THEY SHALL MEAN THE HOWARD
12 COUNTY PLUMBING AND GA§F!TTING CODE ADOPTED PURSUANT TO
13 TiTLE 3, SUBTITLE 3 OF THE "HowARD COUNTY CODE.
14 102.7.7 MECHANICAL. ‘WHENEVER THE TERM “INTERNATIONAL
15 MECHANICAL CODE” IS USED IN THIS CODE, IT SHALL MEAN THE
16 MECHANICAL CODE OF HOWARD COUNTY ADOPTED PURSUANT TO
17 TITLE 3, SUBTITLE 1 oF THE HOWARD COUNTY CODE.
18 102.7. 8 ZONING WHENEVER THE TERM “INTERNATIONAL ZONING
19 CODQ.” lS USED IN THIS CODE, IT SHALL MEAN THE HOWARD
20 COUNTY ZONING REGULATIONS AS ADOPTED PURSUANT TO TITLE
21 _ 6 oF THE HOWARD COUNTY CODE.
22 (8) SECT 'ON 103 DEPARTMENT OF PROPERTY MAINTENANCE INSPECTION.
23 L,ETE THE NAME OF THIS SECTION AND SUBSTITUTE “DEPARTMENT OF
24
25
26 DELETE THIS SUBSECTION AND SUBSTITUTE THE FOLLOWING:
27 103.1 GENERAL, 'THE CODE OFFICIAL IS THE DIRECTOR OF THE
28 DEPARTMENT OF INSPECTIONS, LICENSES AND PERMITS OR THE DIRECTOR’S

AUTHORIZED DESIGNEE.

W
=RV

(10) SussecTiON 103.2 APPOINTMENT.

DELETE THIS SUBSECTION,



[a—

(11)

(12)

(13)

(14)

=T =T N = L B~ v B o

e e e e T
ol W N~ D

(15)

B o NN = e e e
W N = O e e N

(16)

[SO I S R T e
DO -1 v U

30

SUBSECTION 103.3 DEPUTIES.
DELETE THIS SUBSECTION.
SuBSECTION 103.4 LIABILITY.
DELETE THIS SUBSECTION.
SuBsSECTION 103.5 FEES.

DELETE THIS SUBSECTION.

SUBSECTION 104.3 RIGHT OF ENTRY. .

DELETE THIS SUBSECTION AND SUBSTITUTE THE FOLLOWING!

104.3 RiGHT OF ENTRY, THE CODE OFFICIAL IS AufEiORIZED TO ENTER A
DWELLING UNIT, PROPERTY, OR PREMISES ATlRE'ASONABLE TIMES SOLELY
FOR THE PURPOSE OF INSPECTING FOR COMPLIANCE WITH THIS CODE. IF
ENTRY IS REFUSED, THE CODE OFFICIAL ;_;i}iAY SEEK A COURT ORDER TO
PERMIT ENTRY AND FREE ACCESS TO THE DWELLING UNIT, PROPERTY, OR
PREMISES.

SUBSECTION 104.3.1 OCCUP{;i_:f\?f OR TENANT TO GIVE ACCESS.

ADD NEW SUBSECTION IOE{L;;,‘é.i AFTER SUBSECTION 104.3 AS FOLLOWS:
104.3.1 OCCUPANT OR /TENANT 70O GIVE ACCESS. AN OCCUPANT OR TENANT
OF A DWELLING UNIT;'?ROPERTY, OR PREMISES SHALL GIVE ACCESS TO ANY
PART OF THE DWELLING UNIT, PROPERTY, OR PREMISES FOR THE PURPOSE OF

fONS, MAINTENANCE, REPAIRS, OR ALTERATIONS AS ARE

NECESSARY.TO COMPLY WITH THIS CODE. ACCESS MUST BE PROVIDED

DURING N iiMAL BUSINESS HOURS OR AT A TIME THAT HAS BEEN MUTUALLY

lPON BY BOTH THE LANDLORD AND THE TENANT.

ngiéﬁ‘cnozv 104.3.2 PROPERTY OWNER RIGHT OF ENTRY.

ADD NEW SUBSECTION 104.3.2 AFTER NEW SUBSECTION 104.3.1 AS

FOLLOWS:

104.3.2 PROPERTY OWNER RIGHT OF ENTRY. THE PROPERTY OWNER SHALL
GIVE THE TENANT OR OCCUPANT AT LEAST 24-HOURS WRITTEN OR VERBAL
NOTICE PRIOR TO ENTRY FOR REPAIRS. EXCEPTION: EMERGENCY

SITUATIONS,



D - L B MU V. -G VC B R

[ N e T L e N o O S el o e e e e B S e o
o R+ ¥ T o =~ R - - B R+ A S A = B

amn

(18)

(19)

t/fl/
f/,
Vi

/¥ LICENSES AND PERMITS MAY SUSPEND, REVOKE, OR REFUSE TO RENEW A

SUBSECTION 106.1 UNLAWFUL ACTS.

DELETE THIS SUBSECTION AND SUBSTITUTE THE FOLLOWING:

106.1 UNLAWFUL ACTS. AN OWNER, OCCUPANT, OR TENANT SHALL NOT
ERECT, CONSTRUCT, ALTER, EXTEND, REPAIR, REMOVE, DEMOLISH,
MAINTAIN, FAIL TO MAINTAIN, PROVIDE, FAIL TO PROVIDE, OCCUPY PE‘R;J‘.*, T

ANOTHER PERSON TO OCCUPY ANY PREMISES, PROPERTY, DWELLI / IT,

CONVICTION, 1S SUBJECT TO A FINE KIOT EXCEEDING $1,000, OR

IMPRISONMENT, NOT EXCEED%' 0 DAYS, OR BOTH, ALTERNATIVELY, AND
IN ADDITION TO AND CONQQRRENT WITH ALL OTHER REMEDIES AT LAW OR
AT EQUITY, THE DEPA}{’FM%NT OF INSPECTIONS, LICENSES AND PERMITS
MAY ENFORCE THIS (c"’ BE WITH CIVIL PENALTIES AS PROVIDED IN TITLE 24

OF THE HowARD COUNTY CODE, A VIOLATION OF THIS

“CIVIL PENALT /)ZS”'

SUBTITLE 1sf;g§k' 1.ASS B OFFENSE. EACH DAY THAT A VIOLATION CONTINUES
i

ISA SEPA}({ AE OFFENSE,
S Ussgc YON 106.4 VIOLATION PENALTIES.
ng,;éﬁ THIS SUBSECTION, RENAME, AND SUBSTITUTE THE FOLLOWING:

6.4 REVOCATION. THE DIRECTOR OF THE DEPARTMENT OF INSPECTIONS,

RENTAL HOUSING LICENSE IF THE CODE OFFICIAL FINDS THAT AN OWNER OF
A PROPERTY HAS VIOLATED A PROVISION OF THIS CODE, THIS TITLE, OR
REGUL.AT[ONS THAT IMPLEMENT THIS TITLE IN CONNECTION WITH THE
CONSTRUCTION, MAINTENANCE, ALTERATION, OR REPAIR OF A PREMISES,

PROPERTY, DWELLING UNIT, EQUIPMENT, OR LAND WITHIN HOWARD



COUNTY. THE DIRECTOR MAY REVOKE A RENTAL HOUSING LICENSE IF IT 18

R

DISCOVERED THAT THE OWNER OR APPLICANT MISREPRESENTED

2
3 THEMSELVES OR FALSIFIED RECORDS RELATING TO THE LICENSE A§12z
4 HAS BEEN ISSUED MULTIPLE NOTICES OF VIOLATIONS AND/OR .C"i;féftrlorqs.
5 (20) Suvussecrion 106.5 ABATEMENT OF VIOLATION. i
6 DELETE THIS SUBSECTION.
7 (21) SuBsecTION 107.2 FORM.
8 4y ITEM 4, AFTER “DWELLING UNIT OR” DEI?, B “STRUCTURE” AND
9 SUBSTITUTE “PREMISES”.
10 (1)  DELETEITEMS 5 AND 6.
11 (22) SUBSECTION 107.5. PENALTIES.
12 DELETE “106.4” AND SUBSTITUT
13 (23) SuBSECTION 108.1.5 DANGER US STRUCTURE OR PREMISES.
14 DELETE ITEM 11.
15 (24) SusseEcTiON 108.2 Cf; i§ING OF VACANT STRUCTURES.
16 (D IN THE TITLE;,‘_{S’ELETE “CLOSING OF” AND SUBSTITUTE “SECURING”,
17 (i INTHE F}}}:S, AND SECOND SENTENCE, DELETE “CLOSE UP” AND
18 SUBsgj‘ TE “SECURE AGAINST CASUAL ENTRY”.
19 (i)  INT SECOND SENTENCE, DELETE “CLOSED AND”,
20 (1v) ? HIE SECOND SENTENCE, AFTER “PRIVATE PERSONS”, INSERT A
21 ;.,}E:RIOD AND DELETE THE REMAINDER OF THIS SECTION;
22 ( AFTER “PERSONS.” INSERT “THE OWNER IS RESPONSIBLE FOR
23 REIMBURSING THE COUNTY FOR THE COST OF NECESSARY REPAIRS.
24 THE DIRECTOR OF FINANCE SHALL BILL THE OWNER FOR THE COST
25 OF THE WORK. THE OWNER SHALL PAY THE BILL FOR THE WORK
26 WITHIN 30 DAYS OF BILLING. IF THE OWNER DOES NOT PAY THE BILL
27 WITHIN 30 DAYS, THE CODE OFFICIAL MAY SEEK A COURT ORDER |
28 REQUIRING THE OWNER TO REIMBURSE THE COUNTY FOR THE COST
29 OF REPAIRS.”
30 (vi)  DELETE SUBSECTION 108.2.1.



—

O e = T Y
= R - .

17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24

(=T e R s T ~ A T = B - R A

25)

(26)

27)

(28)

SUBSECTION 108.4 PLACARDING.
IN THE FIRST SENTENCE, DELETE “BEARING” THROUGH THE END OF THE
SENTENCE AND SUBSTITUTE THE FOLLOWING:

BEARING THE PHRASE “UNLICENSED PREMISES, UNLAWFUL TO OCCUPY.

OBTAINED.”,

SUBSECTION 109.4 EMERGENCY REPAIRS.

THE OWNER IS RESPONSIBLE FOR REIMBURS]NQ'%' ¢ COUNTY FOR THE COST

)
OF NECESSARY REPAIRS. THE DIRECTOR OFDip ANCE SHALL BILL THE

OWNER FOR THE COST OF THE WORK. TH% WNER SHALL PAY THE BILL FOR
._-’/"! ’wf‘f
THE WORK WITHIN 30 DAYS OF BILLIN( ﬁ?F THE OWNER DOES NOT PAY THE

BILL WITHIN 30 DAYS, THE CODB,G}E;%?CIAL MAY SEEK A COURT ORDER

REQUIRING THE OWNER TO REI%}%%RSE THE COUNTY FOR THE COST OF
A

REPAIRS.

SUBSECTION 109.5 CoS180F EMERGENCY REPAIRS.

%UfB TLE 3 OF THE HOWARD COUNTY CODE.
LA 5

pr: {UBSECTION 110.3 FAILURE TO COMPLY.

e
) fé) AFTER “PRIVATE PERSONS™:

A. DELETE THE COMMA AND INSERT A PERIOD; AND

B. DELETE THE REMAINDER OF THE SECTION AFTER “PERSONS.”
()  AFTER “PERSONS.” INSERT THE FOLLOWING:

“THE OWNER IS RESPONSIBLE FOR REIMBURSING THE COUNTY FOR

THE COST OF NECESSARY REPAIRS. THE DIRECTOR OF FINANCE




R T < R N . T L ¥ N

N NN NN NN RN e e e e e e e e e e
=B - ¥ S = = T - - T B S O B S L o™ B ==

30

(30)

(1)

(32)

SHALL BILL THE OWNER FOR THE COST OF THE WORK. THE OWNER

SHALL PAY THE BILL FOR THE WORK WITHIN 30 DAYS OF BILLING. [F./}

THE OWNER DOES NOT PAY THE BILL WITHIN 30 DAYS, THE CODE

OFFICIAL MAY SEEK A COURT ORDER REQUIRING THE OWNER /£¢F"

SECTION 111 MEANS OF APPEAL.,
DELETE THIS SECTION IN ITS ENTIRETY.
SEcTION 112 STOP WORK ORDER.

DELETE THIS SECTION IN ITS ENTIRETY.
SECTION 202 GENERAL DEFINITIONS.
(D DELETE THE DEFINITION FOR “DWEI; G UNIT” AND SUBSTITUTE
THE FOLLOWING: '

[BG] DWELLING UNIT. A BUILBING, STRUCTURE, OR ANY PORTION

Iy
PERSONS, INCLUDiNgﬁERMANENT PROVISIONS FOR LIVING, EATING,

A n

'ON OR SLEEPING. A DWELLING UNIT SHALL

[A] OWNER. A PERSON, AGENT, OPERATOR, FIRM, OR CORPORATION
HAVING A LEGAL OR EQUITABLE INTEREST IN THE DWELLING UNIT;
HOLDING RECORDED TITLE IN THE OFFICIAL RECORDS OF THE STATE,
COUNTY, OR MUNICIPALITY; OR JOINTLY OR SEVERALLY HAVING
CONTROL OF THE PROPERTY, INCLUDING, WITHOUT LIMITATION, AN
EXECUTOR, ADMINISTRATOR, TRUSTEE, RECEIVER, GUARDIAN, OR

OTHER REPRESENTATIVE APPOINTED ACCORDING TO LAW, AND THE



MO FU R - |

O -1 O Lh

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

SENIOR OFFICER, DIRECTOR, OR TRUSTEE OF THE ASSOCIATION OF
UNIT OWNERS OF A CONDOMINIUM,

(III)  ADD THE FOLLOWING ALPHABETICALLY WITHIN THIS SECTION

(33) SuUBSECTION 302.4 WEEDS.
INSERT “12 INCHES” WHERE INDICATED.
(34)

(33

(36)

YSUBSECTION 304.3.1 PREMISES IDENTIFICATION FOR APARTMENTS AND
CoNDO UNITS.

ADD NEW SUBSECTION 304.3.1 AFTER SECTION 304.3 AS FOLLOWS!
304.3.1 PREMISES IDENTIFICATION FOR APARTMENTS AND CONDO UNITS,
CONDO AND APARTMENT UNITS SHALL HAVE UNIT NUMBERS POSTED ON
EXTERIOR DOORS TO UNIT.

SUBSECTION 304,14 INSECT SCREENS.

10



DELETE “DURING THE PERIOD FROM [DATE] TO [DATE],”.
(3% SussectioN 305.1.1 UNSAFE CONDITIONS.

DELETE THIS SECTION IN ITS ENTIRETY.

(40) SUBSECTION 305.3.1 LEAD-BASED PAINT.

ADD NEW SUBSECTION 305.3.1 AFTER SUBSECTION 305 %

305.3.1. LEAD-BASED PAINT THE OWNER OF A DWEf«bﬂgG UNIT SHALL

(41)

42

(i1} AT THE‘ XD OF THIS SUBSECTION, AFTER “RUBBISH.” INSERT:

EXQEPT‘ION THE OCCUPANT OF A ONE-FAMILY DWELLING SHALL BE

J';Sf’ONSIBLE FOR THE SAFE AND SANITARY STORAGE AND REMOVAL
ALL RUBBISH AND RECYCLABLES.
(43) Sy ;é CTION 308.3.1 GARBAGE FACILITIES.

épb(THE FOLLOWING AT THE END OF THIS SUBSECTION:

/,f{giXCEPTION THE OCCUPANT OF A ONE-FAMILY DWELLING SHALL BE
gr
{4

RESPONSIBLE FOR THE SAFE AND SANITARY STORAGE AND REMOVAL OF ALL
GARBAGE.
4)  SUBSECTION 309.1 INFESTATION.
n IN THE FIRST SENTENCE DELETE “INSECT” AND SUBSTITUTE “INSECT,
VERMIN,”.
() IN THE SECOND SENTENCE:
A, DELETE “INSECTS” AND SUBSTITUTE “INSECTS, VERMIN,”;

AND

11



B. DELETE “EXTERMINATED BY APPROVED PROCESSES” AND

—

SUBSTITUTE “ELIMINATED BY A PROCESS APPROVED BY THE -

DEPARTMENT OF INSPECTIONS, LICENSES AND PERMITS?,

B

(45) Susection 309.1.1 WILDLIFE AND PROTECTED SPECIES,

(46) SUBSECTION 309.1.2 OCCUPANT RESPONSIBILITY;

S B e -1 G Lt b W N
o)
-
v}
[#2]
ey}
el
=
O
z
(o)
o
o
—
-
&
!
5
3
m
>
zZ
lw]
5~}
=
(@)
._]
ley)
le!
-ui
gl
jw]
w
=
wm
a
s}

FOLLOWS:

—

L
JSIBILITY. THE OCCUPANT SHALL

5V

SUBSECTION 309.1.2 OCCUPANT RESP

fa—
—

12 PREPARE THEIR DWELLING UNIT FOR CONTROL TREATMENT AS
13 NECESSARY.

14 (47) SUBSECTION 309.2 OWNER.

15 DELETE “PRIOR TO RENTING &R LEASING THE STRUCTURE”,

16 (48)  SUBSECTION 309.3 SI/N&E"[ /: OCCUPANT.

17 DELETE THIS SUBSE '{jON

18 (49) SUBSECTION 3094,

19 DELETE THIS § i %CTION.

20 (50) SusskcTio b.s OCCUPANT.

21 DELET%@{ ;s SUBSECTION.

22 (51)  Sussky ﬁozv 403.5 CLOTHES DRYER EXHAUST.

23 A /:E END OF THE PARAGRAPH, AFTER “INSTRUCTIONS” ADD “AND LOCAL
24 AL PTED MECHANICAL CODES”,

25 SUBSECTION 403.5.1 DRYER VENTING TRANSITION DUCTS.

ADD NEW SUBSECTION 403.5.1 AFTER SUBSECTION 403.5 AS FOLLOWS:;

b
==

403.5.1 DRYER VENTING TRANSITION DUCTS. TRANSITION DUCTS USED TO

b
-1

CONNECT THE DRYER TO THE EXHAUST DUCT SYSTEM SHALL BE A SINGLE

b
oo

LENGTH THAT IS LISTED AND LABELED IN ACCORDANCE WITH UL 2158A.

3]
o

30 TRANSITION DUCTS SHALL BE A MAXIMUM OF 8 FEET (2438 MM} IN LENGTH

31 AND SHALL NOT BE CONCEALED WITHIN CONSTRUCTION,

12




[owe

(53) SUBSECTION 404.1 PRIVACY.

2 AT THE BEGINNING OF THE SENTENCE, DELETE “DWELLING UNITS” AND
3 SUBSTITUTE “SLEEPING ROOMS WITHIN DWELLING UNITS”.
4 (54) SUBSECTION 404.8 LOCATION OF FOOD PREPARATION EQUIPMENT.
5 ADD NEW SUBSECTION 404,8 AFTER SUBSECTION 404.7 AS FOLLOWS:
6 404.8 LOCATION OF FOOD PREPARATION EQUIPMENT, A PERSON SH,
7 NOT USE PORTABLE COOKING EQUIPMENT INCLUDING, BUT NOT L1, VIITED TO,
8 A BARBEQUE, CHARCOAL OR PROPANE GRILL, OR STOVE INS @@%R WITHIN
9 15 FEET OF A MULTIFAMILY DWELLING. '
i0 (55) SUBSECTION 503.4 FLOOR SURFACE.
11 DELETE “IN OTHER THAN DWELLING UNITS, EVE f’f& AND SUBSTITUTE
12 | “EVERY”,
13 (56) SUBSECTION 505.2.1 WATER POTABILIT, :
14 )
15
16
17 PROVIDE THE CODE OFFICIA;%WITH A LEGIBLE COPY OF A PASSING WELL
18 POTABILITY TEST THAT/ yo MORE THAN 4 YEARS OLD. RESULTS MUST BE
19 EXISTING COMAR (CoDE OF MARYLAND
20
21 (57) )3 ,zi? SUPPL Y.
22 ’ "THE SENTENCE, DELETE “DEFECTS AND LEAKS™ AND
23 CONTAMINATION, DEFECTS, AND LEAKS
24 (58) SGTION 505.4 WATER HEATING FACILITIES,
25 B FIRST SENTENCE, DELETE “AN ADEQUATE AMOUNT” AND SUBSTITUTE
26 ; -‘ 20 MINUTE SUPPLY".
27 SUBSECTION 506.4 SEWAGE BACKUP,
28 ADD NEW SUBSECTION 506.4 AFTER SUBSECTION 506.3 AS FOLLOWS:
29 506.4 SEWAGE BACKUP. IN THE EVENT OF A SEWAGE BACKUP, THE OWNER

SHALL BE REQUIRED TO IMMEDIATELY RESTORE THE PREMISES TO A CLEAN

98]
=

13



AND SANITARY CONDITION BY A PROCESS APPROVED BY THE DEPARTMENT

——

2 OF INSPECTIONS, LICENSES AND PERMITS.
3 (60)  SUBSECTION 602.2 RESIDENTIAL OCCUPANCIES.
4 DELETE THE SUBSECTION AND REPLACE WITH THE FOLLOWING: ,f
5 602.2 RESIDENTIAL OCCUPANCIES. DWELLINGS SHALL BE PRQV"W DED WITH
6 HEATING FACILITIES THAT ARE CONTINUOUSLY MAINTAINE{g IN GOOD
7 WORKING ORDER, AND CAPABLE OF MAINTAINING A }%e’é{vi TEMPERATURE
8 OF 68 DEGREES F (20 DEGREES C) IN ALL HABI’I‘A?}E ROOMS, BATHROOMS,
9 AND TOILET ROOMS BASED ON THE WINTER 2%!2,fYDOOR DESIGN TEMPERATURE
10 FOR THE LOCALITY. COOKING APPLIAI}{% #€ SHALL NOT BE USED, NOR
11 SHALL PORTABLE UNVENTED FUEL- By 'NING SPACE HEATERS USED, AS A
12 MEANS TO PROVIDE HEATING TO MgE. T THE REQUIREMENTS OF THE SECTION.
13 EXCEPTION: IN AREAS WHERE 'I’E AVERAGE MONTHLY TEMPERATURE IS
14 ABOVE 30 DEGREES F (-1 C); @gMFlNIMUM TEMPERATURE OF 65 DEGREES F
15 (18 DEGREES C) SHALL BBﬁﬁA/AINTA]NED
16 (61) SUBSECTION 602.3 H,/l;%’;i TSUPPL Y.
17 0] IN THE FIRS-? f’ ENTENCE, DELETE “{DATE] TO [DATE]” AND
18 SUBSTIT j E “OCTOBER 1 TO MAY 17, AND
19 (1) IN E);gﬁ?TION #1, DELETE THE SECOND SENTENCE,
20 (62) SUBSECT{_"N 602.4 OCCUPIABLE WORK SPACES.
21 : DATE] TO [DATE]” AND SUBSTITUTE “OCTOBER 1 TO MAY 17
22 (63) ; 603.2 REMOVAL 0F COMBUSTION PRODUCTS.
23 THE FOLLOWING AS THE SECOND EXCEPTION TO THIS SUBSECTION
24 CEPTION NUMBER 2: PORTABLE UNVENTED KEROSENE HEATERS ARE NOT
25

SUBSECTION 604.4 ELECTRICAL PANEL CLEARANCES.

fa
[

ADD NEW SUBSECTION 604.4 AFTER SUBSECTION 604.3.2.1 AS FOLLOWS:

b2
~J

604.4 ELECTRICAL PANEL CLEARANCES. A WORKING SPACE OF NOT LESS

THAN 30 INCHES (762 MM) IN WIDTH, 36 INCHES (914 MM) IN DEPTH AND 78

b
o oo

INCHES (1981 MM) IN HEIGHT SHALL BE PROVIDED IN FRONT OF THE

LS
<

ELECTRICAL SERVICE EQUIPMENT. WHERE THE ELECTRICAL SERVICE

w2

14



[a—y

EQUIPMENT IS WIDER THAN 30 INCHES (762 MM), THE WORKING SPACE

2 SHALL NOT BE LESS THAN THE WIDTH OF THE EQUIPMENT. NO STORAGE OF.
3 ANY MATERIALS SHALL BE LOCATED WITHIN THE DESIGNATED WORKT
4 SPACE. A CLEAR UNOBSTRUCTED PATH TO THE ELECTRICAL PANE
5 MAINTAINED.
6 (65) SUBSECTION 605.2.1 PAINTED RECEPTACLES.
7 ADD NEW SUBSECTION 605.2,1 AFTER SUBSECTroNﬁ,’Q
8 605.2.1 PAINTED RECEPTACLES. PAINTED ELEC] ' h&iL RECEPTACLES
9 (OUTLETS) CANNOT BE CLEANED AND MUST
10 (66)  SUBSECTION 605.3 LUMINAIRES.
11 AFTER “EVERY” INSERT “EXTERIOR E
12 (67) SUBSECTION 607.1 GENERAL.
13 AFTER “MAINTAINED”, INSER(:ri‘dN GOOD CONDITION”,
14 (68) SussecTtion701.3 TESTI}V %%ND MAINTENANCE.
15 ADDNEW SUBSECTlo%f@ﬁ% AFTER.SUBSECTION 701.2 AS FOLLOWS:
16 701.3 TESTING AN%&?%;&TENANCE. SPRINKLER SYSTEMS SHALL BE
17 INSPECTED AT L@E%ANNUALLY BY A MARYLAND STATE LICENSED
18 SPRINKLER c%f;iﬁﬁAC’rOR. FIRE ALARM SYSTEMS SHALL BE INSPECTED AT
19 LEAST AN}}/I:{?S{LY BY AN APPROVED COMPANY OR INDIVIDUAL. INSPECTION
20 RBPOR’I;%%%%) DEFICIENCY CORRECTION REPORTS MUST BE PROVIDED
21 ANNI,i‘gﬁJY TO THE CODE OFFICIAL.
22 %) § ﬁﬁbrmfv 702.1.1 EMERGENCY PLANNING.
23 AIPD NEW SUBSECTION 702.1.1 AFTER SUBSECTION 702.1 AS FOLLOWS:
24 " %,; 702.1.1 EMERGENCY PLANNING. THE ADMINISTRATION OF BVERY
25 ﬁ RESIDENTIAL CARE FACILITY OR ASSISTED LIVING FACILITY SHALL HAVE A
26 PLAN IN EFFECT TO PROTECT INDIVIDUALS IN THE EVENT OF A FIRE. THE
27 PLAN SHALL BE IN WRITING AND SHALL BE AVAILABLE TO ALL SUPERVISORY
28 PERSONNEL. THE PLAN SHALL BE AMENDED TO ENSURE THE SAFETY OF ALL
29 RESIDENTS AND SHALL BE AMENDED OR REVISED AS THE RESIDENTS OR

THEIR NEEDS CHANGE. STAFF SHALL BE INSTRUCTED OF THEIR DUTIES AND

(%3
[om=

RESPONSIBILITIES UNDER THE PLAN AND A RECORD OF SUCH INSTRUCTIONS -

15



B W N

o N 00 )] N Lh

11

13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24

SHALL BE MAINTAINED. A COPY OF THE PLAN SHALL BE READILY

AVAILABLE AT ALL TIMES WITHIN THE FACILITY.
(70)  SUBSECTION 702.5 ARRANGEMENT.

ADD NEW SUBSECTION 702.5 AFTER SUBSECTION 702.4 AS FOI

702.5 ARRANGEMENT. THE REQUIRED PATH OR TRAVEL FR(EM??&NY ROOM

(71)

(72)

(73) PRI
ADD NEW SUBSEC)’( 'ﬁf 704,8 AFTER SUBSECTION 704.7 AS FOLLOWS!

(74)

6.1 HAZARDOUS MATERIALS. UNLESS STORAGE COMPLIES WITH THE

APPLICABLE REQUIREMENTS OF THE HOWARD COUNTY BUILDING CODE

AND THE HOWARD COUNTY FIRE PREVENTION CODE, A PERSON SHALL NOT

STORE OR ACCUMULATE:

¢y COMBUSTIBLE, FLAMMABLE, EXPLOSIVE, OR OTHER HAZARDOUS
MATERIALS, SUCH AS PAINTS, VOLATILE OILS, OR CLEANING FLUIDS;
OR

()  COMBUSTIBLE RUBBISH, SUCH AS WASTEPAPER, BOXES AND RAGS.

16



D SE =) St s e b e

[T G T Y SN N S O R G SR N N o N N S & B e e i e
\OWQC\M&NNMO\DW‘JO\U\&MMH‘O

706.2 STORAGE OF VEHICLES THAT CONTAIN HAZARDOUS MATERIALS,;

A COMMON AREA OF A MULTI-FAMILY DWELLING OWNED BY ONE PER ﬁ
' v

GASOLINE.

706.3 STORAGE OF ITEMS AND EQUIPMENT INMG

]('iﬁ"r

HoTELS/MOTELS. ALL AREAS OF EGRESS, CQMK%ON TRAVEL AND REFUGE

f,r;

SHALL BE FREE OF STORAGE, FURNISH[NGS‘) BECORATIONS AND/OR
(f ,

TI—FA MiLY DWELLINGS,

OBSTRUCTIONS.
4 ig?
706.4 STORAGE IN SPRINKLER EQtf 7 1ENT ROOMS. SPRINKLER

(75) DELETE APPENDIXA "

Section 14.900, Defifit

In this subtitle thgfollowing terms have the meanings indicated.

(£) “Howard @funty Property Maintenance Code for Rental Housing” means the
Internation' roperty Maintenance Code, [[2006]] 2018 Edition, as adopted in Title 3,
Subtitle 740f the Howard County Code.

Secfion 2. And Be It Further Enacted by the County Council of Howard County,
ryland, that this Act shall become effective 61 days after its enactment.

17



L B ¢ < B = T ¥ B ¥ & I S I

e N T N O Y
L I N 7> B~ FU R NS E O

Amendment _“L to Council Bill No. 15-2019

BY: The Chairperson at the request Legislative Day L@
of the County Executive Date: May 6, 2019

Amendment No. '

(This amendment:

1. Ensures that landlord tenant provisions related to rights of entry that are contained elsewhere
in the Code are applied;

2. Removes redundant authority related to the revocation of a license;

3. Allows for more discretion related to the removal of shrubs and bushes and clarifies that only
bushes and shrubs that impede egress and ingress are regulated;

4. Allows for more discretion related to the determination of the adequacy of hot water; and

5. Prohibits, generally, storage around an electrical panel and requires a clear, unobstructed
path to an electrical panel.)

On page 5, in line 9, strike “THE” and substitute “SUBJECT TO TITLE 14, SUBTITLE 9 AND TITLE

17. SUBTITLE 10 OF THE HOWARD CouUNTY CODE, THE”,

On page 5, in line 17, strike “AN” and substitute “SUBJECT TO TiTLE 14, SUBTITLE 9 AND

TiTLEL 7, SUBTITLE 10 oF THE HOWARD COUNTY CODE, AN”,

On page 5, in line 27, strike “THE” and substitute “SUBJECT TO TITLE 14, SUBTITLE 9 AND

TrrLEl 7, SUBTITLE 10 oF THE HOowWARD COUNTY CODE, THE”.

On page 7, in line 3, strike “AND/OR™ and substitute a period.

On page 7, strike line 4.

On page 10, strike beginning with “FOLIAGE” in line 13 down through and including “FACE.” in

line 15,

On page 13, strike lines 24 through 26, inclusive and in their entirety.



19
20
21
22
23
24
25
26
27
28
29
30
31
32
33
34
35
36
37
38
39
40
41
42
43
44
45
46
47
48
49
50
51

On page 13, in line 27, strike “(59)” and substitute “(58)”.

On page 14, in line 3, strike “(60)” and substitute “(39)”.

On page 14, in line 16, strike “(61)” and substitute “(60)”.

On page 14, in line 20, strike “(62)” and substitute “(61)”.

On page 14, in Iine 22, strike “(63)” and substitute “(62)”.

On page 14, in line 26, strike “(64)” and substitute “(63)”.

Strike beginning with “A” on page 14, in line 28 down through and including “SPACE.” on page

15, in line 4 and substitute “MATERIALS SHALL NOT BE STORED IN A MANNER THAT OBSTRUCTS

THE ELECTRICAL PANEL OR OTHERWISE CREATES A HAZARD.”.

On page 15, in line 6, strike “(65)” and substitute “(64)”.

On page 15, in line 10, strike “(66)” and substitute “(65)”.

On page 15, in line 12, strike “(67)” and substitute “(66)”.

On page 13, in line 14, strike “(68)” and substitute “(67)”.

On page 15, in line 22, strike “(69)” and substitute “(68)”.

On page 16, in line 3, strike “(70)” and substitute “(69)”.

On page 16, in line 9, strike “(71)” and substitute “(70)”.

On page 16, in line 14, sirike “(72)” and substitute “(71)”.

On page 16, in line 16, strike “(73)” and substitute “(72)”.
2



52
53
54
55

On page 16, in line 21, strike “(74)” and substitute “(73)”.

On page 17, in line 17, strike “(75)” and substitute “(74)”.



Masvzann MULTE-HOUSING ASSOCIATION, ING,

Bill Subject: Council Bill 15 -2019
Date: April 22, 2019

Position: Favorable with Amendments

The Maryland Multi-Housing Association (MMHA) is a professional trade association
established in 1996, whose membership consists of owners and property managers of more than
200,000 rental housing homes in more than 870 apartment communities. Our members house
over 556,000 residents of the State of Maryland. MMHA membership also includes more than
200 associate members who supply goods and services to the multi-housing industry. Lastly, in
Howard County, MMHA members own and/or manage over 17,000 units.

CB 15- 2019 updates the Howard County Property Maintenance Code for Rental Housing
to incorporate the 2018 edition of the International Property Maintenance Code with focal
amendments, MMHA supports this legisiation’s goals of improving the safety and quality of the
County’s rental housing stock. MMHA requests the following friendly amendments, which we
have worked on with the Department of Inspections, Licenses and Permits and the County
Administration,

Our amendment requests are as follows:

s Code Subsection 104.3 Right of Entry: For purposes of consistency, this subsection

should be subjected to the ability of a landlord to access the premises as stated in the
Section 17, Subtitle 10 and Title 14, Subtitle 9 of the Howard County Code.

¢ Code Subsection 106.4 Violation Penalties: “Multiple notices” is undefined resulting in

inconsistent application, For instance, under this provision, a {000-unit complex with five
notices of violations would be treated the same as a single unit property with five notices
of violations. As a result, MMHA urges that the Council strike “AND/OR HAS BEEN

ISSUED MULTIPLE NOTICES OF VIOLATIONS AND/OR CITATIONS.”

Page 1 of 2



MARVLAND MULTT-UMOUSING ASSOCTATION, INC.

Code Subsection 302.4.1 Bushes and Shrubs: MMHA supports language requiring that

bushes and shrubs are maintained and may not block ingress and egress. The current bill
provision, however, includes height and distance specifications. MMHA urges removal
of those specifications because they are too specific and superfluous.

Code Subsection 505.4 Water Heating Facilities: MMHA certainly recognizes the need to

maintain hot water and accompanying facilities, However, this provision of 20 minutes of
hot running water is overly specific and unrealistic. MMHA requests removal of this
clause since there are many factors that determine the availability of hot water, such as
other appliances running at the same time.

Code Subsection 604.4 Electrical Panel Clearances: This Code Subsection dictates

specific work space width and height dimensions allowed in front of or near an electrical
panel, MMHA members recognize the importance of providing acceptable clearance in
and around these panels. However, MMHA suggests strike the language related to the
dimensions and instead amend (o prohibit storage of materials in a manner that obstructs

electrical panels.

For the foregoing reasons, MMHA urges a favorable report with amendments. If you have

any questions, please do not hesitate to contact us,

Jessie Keller, MMHA Government and Community Affairs Manager, 410-413-1420

Katherine Kelly Howard, MMHA 1.egislative Committee Chair, 410-539-2370

Page 2 0f 2



HOWARD COUNTY COUNCIL
AFFIDAVIT OF AUTHORIZATION
TO TESTIFY ON BEHALF OF AN ORGANIZATION

|, Jessie Keller , have been duly authorized by

(name of individual)

Maryland Multi-Housing Association to deliver testimony to the

{(name of nonprofit organization or government board, commission, or task force)

CB 15-2019

(bill or resolution number)

County Council regarding to express the organization’s

r Popposition to / request to amend this legislation,
(Please circle one.)

Printed Name: Jessie Keller

Signature:

Date: 042212019

Organization: Maryland Multi-Housing Association

Owings Mills, MD 21117

Organization Address:

Owings Mills, MD 21117

Number of Members: 1 275
Name of Chair/President; Steve M argerum

This form can be submitted electronically via email to councilmail@howardcountymd.gov no later than 5pm
the day of the Public Hearing or delivered in person the night of the Public Hearing before testifying.




