
Amendment J_ to Council Resolution No. 142-2019

BY: Deb Jung and Legislative Day No.
Liz Walsh

Date: T')€.c&^A3b€jr Zi

Amendment No. \, _

(This Amendment alters thefees-in-lieufor afforestation or reforestation.)

1 On the schedule for fee-in-lieu, as shown in Exhibit A attached to the Resolution, in the

2 "Afforestation or reforestation" category, strike "$1.25" and substitute "$5.00" and strike

3 "$ 1.50" and substitute "$6.00".

4

5

fWTEO._.

FAIIEB -^L^J0
W'^TURE )^3z2UL^-L

T



Amendment 2 to Council Resolution No. 142-2019

BY: Deb Jung and Legislative Day No. 14
Liz Walsh

Date: December 2,2019

Amendment No. 2

(This Amendment alters the fee for non-compliance.)

1 On the schedule for fee-in-lieu, as shown in Exhibit A attached to the Resolution, in the "Non-

2 compliance with forest conservation" category, strike "$1.25" and substitute "$5.00".

3

AB&PHB
FAIIEB
S16HATURE

.i2-.?i9-


