D AW

Amendment _l_ to Council Resolution No. 142-2019

BY: Deb Jung and Legislative Day No. H_

Liz Walsh
Date: Deceaaec Z| Z(}\C‘

Amendment No. ||

(This Amendment alters the fees-in-lieu for afforestation or reforestation.)

On the schedule for fee-in-lieu, as shown in Exhibit A attached to the Resolution, in the

“Afforestation or reforestation” category, strike “$1.25” and substitute “$5.00” and strike

“$1.50” and substitute “$6.00”.

ABUPTED

FILED N2 [2 ] 20l
SETNATURE /[ -




Amendment 2 to Council Resolution No. 142-2019

BY: Deb Jung and Legislative Day No. _14

Liz Walsh
Date: December 2, 2019

Amendment No. 2

(This Amendment alters the fee for non-compliance.)

On the schedule for fee-in-lieu, as shown in Exhibit A attached to the Resolution, in the “Non-

compliance with forest conservation” category, strike “$1.25” and substitute “$5.00”.

ADOPTED 12)zf20\]

SIGNATURE \




